
Immigration (Fees) (Amendment No. 3) (Jersey) Order 2013 Article 1
 

 ◊  Page - 1
 

 

 
IMMIGRATION (FEES) (AMENDMENT No. 3) 

(JERSEY) ORDER 2013 

Made   

Coming into force   

THE MINISTER FOR HOME AFFAIRS, in pursuance of sections 5 
and 166(3) of the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999 as extended to Jersey, 
with modifications and exceptions, by the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999 
(Jersey) Order 2003, orders as follows – 

1 Article 2 amended  

In Article 2 of the Immigration (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2010 – 

(a) in paragraph (2)(a), (2)(b) and (2)(c), for the figure “£561” there is 
substituted the figure “£578”; and 

(b) in paragraph (2)(d), for the figure “£281” there is substituted the figure 
“£433”. 

2 Article 3 amended  

In Article 3 of the Immigration (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2010 – 

(a) in paragraph (1), for the figure “£991” there is substituted the figure 
“£1,051”; and 

(b) in paragraph (2), for the figure “£496” there is substituted the figure 
“£788”. 



Article 3 Immigration (Fees) (Amendment No. 3) (Jersey) Order 2013
 

 
Page - 2  ◊  
 

3 Citation and commencement  

This Order may be cited as the Immigration (Fees) (Amendment No. 3) (Jersey) 
Order 2013 and comes into force on 1st June 2013. 

 

 

Signed.................................................................... 

Date........................................................................ 

Minister for Home Affairs 

 
 



Immigration (Fees) (Amendment No. 3) (Jersey) Order 2013 Endnotes
 

 ◊  Page - 3
 

 

 


